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ANN ARBOR, Mich. – Butzel attorney Jennifer Dukarski will be a
featured speaker during the September 26, 2024, COVESA All
Member Meeting in Novi. She will participate in a panel
discussion titled, “Unlocking Mobility Potential: The Role of
Consented Data in Connected Services.”

The panel discussion will dig into diverse revenue opportunities
utilizing data within mobility. Panelists will consider how personal
and sensitive information must be maintained to be globally
compliant. The group also will give their opinions to an open-
source approach to data privacy and discuss how to create true
business value while building consumer trust.

Dukarski leads Butzel’s Connected and Autonomous Mobility
Team. Her automotive expertise as a former design engineer, Six
Sigma master black belt, continuous improvement lead
champion, and quality manager gives her a unique perspective
on balancing the legal issues and business applications of
emerging automotive technology.

She focuses her legal practice where technology, mobility and
communications meet. A leader in the area of electrified,
connected and automated vehicles, she negotiated some of the
first robotaxi agreements in the world. A champion of the
responsible use of AI, Dukarski regularly advises and teaches on
AI risk mitigation. She was named one of the 30 Women Defining
the Future of Technology by Warner Communications for her
innovative thoughts and contributions to the tech industry.


